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CARTON 
WILSON® PREDATOR™ 

RAT BAIT STATION 
PRE-FILLED 

 
 

Ready To Use 
 
 

Kills Norway Rats and Roof Rats 
 
 

SOLID 
 
 

DOMESTIC 
 

REG. NO. 32153 PCP ACT 
 

GUARANTEE: Chlorophacinone.......0.005% 
 

Warning, contains the allergens peanuts, wheat, soy and fish 
 
 

KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN 
READ THE LABEL BEFORE USING 

 
THIS BAIT STATION IS NOT TAMPER RESISTANT. 

USE INDOORS ONLY IN AREAS INACCESSIBLE TO CHILDREN AND PETS. 
 
 
 

1 disposable bait station (contains 113 g of bait) 
 
 
 
 

Sure-Gro IP Inc./Lic. Premier Tech Home & Garden Inc. 
P.O. Box 21001, Brantford, ON  N3R 7W9 

1-800-268-2806 
 

 



 

DIRECTIONS FOR USE / USE LIMITATIONS: Use Wilson® Predator™ Rat Bait Station 
Pre-Filled for the control of Norway rats (Rattus norvegicus) and Roof rats (Rattus rattus) 
INDOORS IN LOCATIONS NOT ACCESSIBLE TO CHILDREN, PETS, DOMESTIC 
ANIMALS, OR NON-TARGET WILDLIFE. DO NOT USE THIS PRODUCT OUTDOORS. 
DO NOT place bait in areas where there is a possibility of contaminating food or surfaces that 
come in direct contact with food. 

Selection of Treatment Areas: Place bait in locations rats travel and will most likely find and 
consume the bait. Placement along walls, by gnawed openings, in corners and concealed places, 
between floors or walls, or in locations where rats or their signs have been seen. Remove as 
much alternative food as possible. 

APPLICATION DIRECTIONS: Remove bait station from package and place in horizontal 
position with side against wall, exposing entrance. For Norway Rats (Rattus norvegicus) and 
Roof Rats (Rattus rattus): Norway rats usually inhabit the ground floor of structures and burrow 
in the ground. They will range approximately 15 to 100 m from their nesting area seeking food 
and water. Roof rats, however, are excellent climbers and usually infest the upper stories of 
structures. Hence, special attention must be paid to this species ability to climb by placing baits 
in the roof rats activity area. For both species, eliminate as much of the naturally occurring food 
as possible and place 1 to 5 bait stations (at intervals of 5-10 m) within the treatment area. 
Maintain an uninterrupted supply of fresh bait for at least 10 days, or until signs of rat activity 
cease. 

Replace bait stations if contents are consumed or contaminated. Wearing rubber gloves, collect 
and dispose of all dead animals and unconsumed bait properly. To prevent reinfestation, 
eliminate food, water and harbourage as much as possible. If reinfestation occurs, repeat 
treatment. Where a continuous source of infestation is present, establish permanent bait stations 
as necessary. 

PRECAUTIONS: KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN, PETS AND LIVESTOCK. 
May be harmful or fatal if swallowed or absorbed through the skin. Rubber gloves must be worn 
when handling product and when disposing of dead rodents, unconsumed bait and empty 
containers. Avoid contact with eyes, skin or clothing. Wash hands before eating, drinking, 
chewing gum, using tobacco or using the toilet. Wash skin thoroughly with soap and water after 
handling. Wash contaminated clothing, separately from other laundry, with soap and hot water 
before reuse. KEEP AWAY FROM FEED AND FOODSTUFFS. This product is toxic to fish 
and wildlife. Keep out of lakes, streams or ponds. 

FIRST AID: If in eyes, hold eye open and rinse slowly and gently with water for 15-20 minutes. 
Remove contact lenses, if present, after the first 5 minutes, then continue rinsing eye. Call a 
poison control centre or doctor for treatment advice. If on skin or clothing, take off 
contaminated clothing. Rinse skin immediately with plenty of water for 15-20 minutes. Call a 
poison control centre or doctor for treatment advice. If swallowed, for all cases of human 
ingestion, call a poison control centre or doctor immediately for treatment advice. Have person 
sip a glass of water if able to swallow. Do not induce vomiting unless told to do so by a poison 
control centre or doctor. Do not give anything by mouth to an unconscious person. If pet or 



livestock poisoning is suspected, immediately contact a veterinarian. Take container, label or 
product name and Pest Control Product Registration Number with you when seeking medical 
attention. 

TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION: Vitamin K1 in the form of intramuscular or 
subcutaneous injections, or by oral ingestion is a suggested remedial treatment for anticoagulant 
poisoning. The severity of the case measured by establishing prolonged prothrombin times (P.T.) 
will determine appropriate therapy. Monitoring P.T. will indicate the necessity of repeated 
treatments. 

STORAGE AND DISPOSAL: Store in a cool, dry place away from other chemicals and food 
or feed. Store product not in use, in original container, in a secure location inaccessible to 
children and non-target animals. Wrap used or damaged bait stations and discard in household 
garbage. DO NOT use damaged bait station. 

RODENT DISPOSAL: Dead rodents should be securely wrapped and placed in closed 
containers and disposed of in the garbage. Otherwise, securely wrap carcasses and bury to a 
depth that will make them inaccessible to scavengers. 

NOTICE TO USER: This pest control product is to be used only in accordance with the 
directions on the label. It is an offence under the Pest Control Products Act to use this product in 
a way that is inconsistent with the directions on the label. The user assumes the risk to persons or 
property that arises from any such use of this product. 

 

For additional product information or in case of emergency, spills or fire, call toll-free 
1-800-268-2806.   www.pthomeandgarden.com 
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