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Hartz® UltraGuard Plus®  
Flea & Tick Collar for Dogs and Puppies 

Slow-Release Generator 
WHITE COLLAR 

 
Kills: 
Adult Fleas 
Adult Ticks 
Plus Kills  
Flea Eggs 
For 7 Months 
 
GUARANTEE:  
Tetrachlorvinphos……..14.55% 
(S)-Methoprene..............1.02% 
Warning, contains the allergen soy 
 
DOMESTIC 
 
READ ENTIRE LABEL BEFORE USING 
 
KEEP OUT OF REACH OF CHILDREN 
 
FOR USE ONLY ON DOGS 
 
REG. NO.: 25382 PCP ACT 
 
Net Contents: g 
 
HARTZ CANADA INC., 
1125 Talbot St. 
St. Thomas, Ontario 
N5P 3W7 
1-800-275-1414 
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DIRECTIONS FOR USE:  
Do NOT remove the collar from its package until ready to use.  Remove the collar from the 
package, unroll and STRETCH to activate. This releases the active ingredient at time of use and 
assures full activity.  Place the flea collar around the dog’s neck, allowing a spacing of 2 fingers 
between collar and neck and buckle in place. Leave 5 to 8 cm on the collar for extra adjustment.  
Cut off any excess length, wrap and dispose of it in the garbage. Wash hands with soap and 
water after handling collar.  
 
When collar is first worn, observe the pet’s neck area every few days for irritation or adverse 
reaction. Do NOT use on dogs under 12 weeks of age. Consult a veterinarian before using on 
sick, aged, pregnant, or nursing animals or animals receiving drug or other pesticide treatment.  
Replace collar every 7 months for continual pest control in situations where there is an ongoing 
risk of pest infestation. Under conditions where pets are exposed to severe flea or tick 
infestations, it may be necessary to replace the collar more frequently. Replace this collar no 
more than once every 3 months. For use when fleas and ticks are a problem. If only ticks are 
problematic, a collar without an insect growth regulator should be used RETAIN PACKAGING  
INFORMATION FOR FUTURE REFERENCE  
 
For effective flea and tick control, treatment of the pet should be combined with sanitation of any 
area used by the pet. Vacuum floors, carpets and furniture (discard vacuum bag after use) and 
wash the pet’s bedding, living quarters and surrounding areas. If pest problems persist, an 
insecticidal premise treatment may be required. A veterinarian should be consulted when pest 
infestation continues to be a problem on the pet. 
 
PRECAUTIONS: 
HUMANS:  Do not allow children to handle the collar. Do not unroll collar until ready to use. 
This collar is intended for use only as an insecticide generator dog collar.  Dust will form on the 
collar during storage. Dust may irritate eyes, nose and throat. Harmful if collar is chewed, or if 
dust is inhaled or absorbed through skin. Avoid contact with mouth, eyes, skin and clothing. 
Avoid breathing dust from collar. After handling or applying, wash hands (or any other skin that 
came into contact with the product) with soap and water. Avoid product contact with food, food 
utensils, or places where food is prepared or stored. 
PETS: Dust may irritate eyes, nose and throat. Harmful if collar is chewed or swallowed. Avoid 
contact with the dog’s mouth, face, eyes and genitals. Avoid letting the pet inhale the dust from 
the collar.  
 
Do not use this product on dogs at the same time or within 30 days before or after treatment with, 
or exposure to, cholinesterase-inhibiting drugs, pesticides, or chemicals.  
  
FIRST AID 
HUMANS: IF CHEWED, Call a poison control centre or doctor immediately for treatment 
advice. Have person sip a glass of water if able to swallow. Do not induce vomiting unless told 
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to do so by a poison control centre or doctor. Do not give anything by mouth to an unconscious 
person. IF ON SKIN OR CLOTHING, Take off contaminated clothing. Rinse skin immediately 
with plenty of water for 15-20 minutes. Call a poison control centre or doctor for treatment 
advice. IF INHALED, Move person to fresh air. If person is not breathing, call 911 or an 
ambulance, then give artificial respiration, preferable by mouth-to-mouth, if possible. IF DUST 
FROM COLLAR GETS IN EYES, Hold eye open and rinse slowly and gently with water for 
15–20 minutes. Remove contact lenses, if present, after the first 5 minutes, then continue rinsing 
eye. Call a poison control centre or doctor for treatment advice. PETS: Sensitivities may occur 
after using ANY pesticide for pets. If signs of sensitivity occur, remove collar and bathe your pet 
with mild soap and rinse with large amounts of water. If signs continue, consult a veterinarian 
immediately. If swallowed or chewed, consult a veterinarian.  
 
Take container, label, or product name and Pest Control Product Registration Number with you 
when seeking medical or veterinary attention.  
 
TOXICOLOGICAL INFORMATION: This product contains a pesticide that is a 
cholinesterase inhibitor (anti-cholinesterase compound). Symptoms of human poisoning may 
include headache, weakness, sweating, blurred vision, nausea and diarrhea. Obtain medical 
attention or call a poison control centre at once. Atropine is antidotal. Acute symptoms of over 
dosages in dogs include diarrhea, salivation, vomiting, muscular tremors and weakness. Contact 
a veterinarian immediately.  
 
 
STORAGE AND DISPOSAL: Store in original, unopened container in a cool place apart from 
food and feed. Wrap and discard excess collar, unwanted (used) collars and packaging in 
household garbage. Do not reuse empty pouch.  
 
 
For more information call our experts at 1-800-275-1414 
Visit www.hartzultraguard.com 
 
Hartz® and other trademarks are trademarks of The Hartz Mountain Corporation 
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